Ordinance

Passed

Amends

8891

12/21/2000

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512

Adds: “No parking” east & west sides 3", Riverview Street
north to bridge over Cedar Creek and railroad; and both
sides U.S. 24 from bridge over Cedar Creek and railroad to
IL 96.

8892

12/26/2000

Chapter 17
Adds: Article VI Locally Imposed And Administered Tax
Rights and Responsibility

8893

1/02/2001

Chapter 11, Article VI, Sections 11.066 and 11.607
Adds: allows hiring for QPD from lIllinois Police Corps

8894

1/02/2001

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(16)
Adds: “No parking 6:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m.” south side of
Harrison, 8th to 9th

8895

1/02/2001

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop” 5th at Washington

8896

1/02/2001

Chapter 33, Article 11, Section 33.304
Adds: price of code book CD $35.00, printed copy without
binder $55.00, printed copy with binder $100.00

8897

1/08/2001

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)
Adds: “No parking” west side of 24th from College Ave.
north for 50’

8898

1/29/2001

Chapter 29, Article XIV, Section 29.1413 and Acrticle VII
Section 29.704(1), (3)
Amends: temporary signs and accessory buildings

8899

1/29/2001

Chapter 29, Article 11, Sections 29.202(&)(b),
29.202(10)(a), 29.202(8)(c), 29.202(10)(a)(13), and Article
IV, Section 29.402(1) and (2), and Section 29.404(6)
Amends: permitted uses in C1B

8900

3/5/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Sections 20.345, 20.330
Deletes: “Yield” Spring to 15"
Adds: “Stop” Spring to 15"

8901

3/5/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, 20.330
Adds: “Stop” Oak at 20"

8902

3/19/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Adds: (148) Maine, north side, 11" Street to westernmost
drive of Quincy Medical Group “No Parking”

8903

3/19/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Adds: “Yield” Golden Grove, Luxury Lane, Amber Ave.,
Diamond Drive all to 18" Street

8904

3/26/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Adds: “Yield” Woodland Trail and Quail Creek to 46"

8905

4/16/01

Chapter 20, Article 11, Sections 20.345, 20.330
Deletes: “Yield” Washington to 15"




Adds: “Stop” Washington to 15"

8906

4/16/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)
Adds: “No Parking” South 6", west side, commencing at
north curb line of Adams and extending north 40’

8907

4/16/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Adds: (149) On north side of the alley from 9" to 10"
between Jackson and VVanBuren “No Parking”

8908

5/7/01

Chapter 20, Article VI, Section 20.601
Adds: (h) parking lot “J”

8909

5/21/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512(148)

Deletes: entire item and substitutes correct one

Adds: Maine Street, north side, commencing at a point
120" east of east curb line of 10" and extending 166" east

8910

6/11/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503(2)
Deletes: one parking space in front of 912 Jackson

8911

6/11/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Adds: (15) East side of Front Street from south curb on
Hampshire to a point 120” south “No Parking”

8912

6/18/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.332
Deletes: “one way” east/west alley, 8" & 9", State & Ohio

8913

6/18/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.506
Deletes: “No Parking” west side of 18" from alley
between State and Ohio south 70’ to the first driveway

8914

6/25/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.320.4
Adds: Wilmar Drive “20 m.p.h. speed limit”

8915

7/9/01

Chapter 29, Articles Il and X1V, Sections 29.202(10)(e)(2),
29.202(8), 29.1411(1)(d)

Adds: motorcycle & ATV sales and service to C2 uses;
financial institutions including teller machines and drive-up
facilities to D4 uses

Amends: ground-mounted signs

8916

7/9/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Adds: “Yield” Bedford to Breckenridge Drive

8917

7/9/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Sections 20.330 and 20.345

Adds: “Stop” 20" to Grove Ave., Payson Ave. to 19", 23"
to Payson Ave.

Deletes: “Yield” Grove Ave. to 20"

8918

8/12/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “3-Way Stop” 16" and York

8919

8/27/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.332
Deletes: “one way” west bound east/west alley between
Broadway and Spring, 5" and 6™

8920

8/27/01

Chapter 13, Article VII, Section 13.712(g)(1) and (g)(2)
Amends: Cost of developer to install decorative street
lights in a subdivision from 3 times to 5 %% times.

8921

9/04/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503(8)




Adds: “1 Hour Parking” 7 a.m. to 7 p.m. on east side of
25™ Street 5 south of Prentiss Ave. extending south to the
first driveway south of Prentiss Ave.

8922

9/04/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.506

Adds: “No Parking” west side of 18" south of the
east/west alley between Chestnut and Lind to 30° south of
College Avenue

8923

9/24/01

Chapter 19, Article XIV
Deletes: entire Article X1V

8924

10/09/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512

Adds: (151) on east and west sides of north/south alley
between Front and Second Streets, Maine and Hampshire.
(152) on east and west sides of alley between Front and
Second Streets, Hampshire and Vermont, commencing at
Hampshire extending 315° north of Hampshire

8925

11/05/01

Chapter 29, Article I, 11, 11, 1V, Sections 29.104(3)(a),
29.202(11), 29.301(4), 29.302, 29.403(9)

Changes height requirement to buildings, yard requirement
set back and adds permitted uses in M1

8926

11/13/01

Chapter 23, amends entire chapter

Deletes: entire Article 111 and succeeding Articles of
Chapter 23 are sequentially renumbered; Article | and new
article inserted; Article V and new article inserted; Article
VIII and new article inserted.

8927

11/26/01

Chapter 29, Article X
Adds: Sections 29.1077, 29.1078, 29.1079

8928

12/10/01

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop” 16" at Payson Avenue

8929

12/10/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)

Increases “No Parking”: south side of Jackson west of 11"
from 40’ to 74’; east side of 12" north of Jackson from 57’
to77

Adds: 58’ of “No Parking” on north side of Maine east of
16" Street

8930

12/17/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)
Adds: “No Parking” east side of 12" commencing at south
curb line of Kentucky and extending south 53’

8931

12/26/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(16)
Amends: “No Parking” footage on both sides of Maine
between 30" and 36™ from 310’ to 640’

8932

12/26/01

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.506
Amends: “No Parking” footage on both sides of Maine
between 36" and 48" from 310’ to 640’

8933

12/26/01

Chapter 29, Article X
Adds: Section 29.1080: 2428, 2432, 2436, 2440, 2444
College Avenue




8934

1/22/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.507
Deletes: “angle parking” south side Vermont, Front to 2™
Adds: “angle parking” north side of Vermont, Front to 2"

8935

1/22/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)

Adds: “No Parking” State, south side, from 16™ west 74;
State, north side, from 16™ east 53’; State, south side, from
a point 55’ west of 9™ extending east 53 east of 9th

8936

3/04/02

Chapter 18, Section 18.008

Chapter 32, Sections 32.002(6), 32.002(8)

Amends: Hours for attendance of minors in night clubs
and fines

8937

3/11/02

Chapter 17, Articles 11l and 1V
Adds % of 1% to city’s occupation tax

8938

3/11/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Adds: “No Parking” east side of 9" at a point 229’ south of
Vermont and extending 15’ south

8939

3/11/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501
Adds: “No Parking” south side of Jefferson from 21 west
60’

8940

4/01/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.508(1) and 20.508(5)
Deletes: “School No Parking” north side of VanBuren
between 8" & 9™ from 8:00 a.m.

Adds: “School No Parking” north side of VanBuren
between 8" & 9" to 7:00 a.m.

8941

4/01/02

Chapter 19 & 26, Sections 19.402, 19.411, 26.003
Amends: Electrical Contractor requirements and
installation fees

8942

4/15/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)
Adds: “No Parking” east side of 10" at a point 64’ north of
Sycamore and extending 102’ north

8943

4/15/02

Chapter 17, Article 11, Section 17.302
Removes: Sunset clause as required by State of Illinois

8944

5/13/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)
Adds: additional parking on west side of 5™ north of
Maine and deletes “left hand” turn lane.

8945

5/28/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512

Adds: (154) and (155) “No Parking” for 15’ either side of
the drive into Blessing Hospital parking lot on the south
side of Oak between 11" and 12th

8946

5/28/02

Chapter 20, Article VI, Section 20.602(2)(b)
Increases: Rental fees on city parking lots to $25.00

8947

5/28/02

Chapter 19, Article 1V, Section 19.404(3)(a) and

Chapter 26, Sections 26.002(1), 26.002(2)(s)

Amends: regulations for testing electrical contractors and
adopts the 2002 Electrical Code




8948

6/03/02

Chapter 13, Article I, Section 13.121
Deletes: “School District Number 172”

8949

6/24/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.506
Adds: “No Parking” south side of alley between 8" & 9™,
Kentucky and State

8950

6/24/02

Chapter 20, Article VI, Section 20.602(b)
Adds: “1 Hour Parking” in front of Brown Drug on Maine

8951

7/15/02

Chapter 21, Article 11, Sections 21.201, 21.202, 21.203,
21.204, 21.220
Adopts 2000 International Fire Code

8952

8/19/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)

Adds: “No Parking” north side of College at a point 141’
east 11" and extending 113’ east; 10", west side, starting
10’ both north & south of each of the 2 driveways into
Blessing’s parking lot between alley north of Broadway and
what use to be Spring Street

8953

8/26/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503(1)
Adds: “2 Hour Parking” west side of 10" 160" south of
Vermont extending south 145’

8954

9/03/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512(155)
Adds: “No Parking” west side of 20" from Chestnut to the
alley between Elm and Lind

8955

9/09/02

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Deletes: “Yield” 9™ to Spring
Adds: “Yield” Spring to 9th

8956

10/07/02

Chapter 2, Articles Ill and 1V
Amends: Sections 2.302 through 2.309 ward boundaries
Deletes: Article IV Precincts in its entirety

8957

10/15/02

Chapters 24 & 25, Sections 24.1905, 25.104
Changes reference to Sewer Account and Water Fund to
Utilities Fund in both sections.

8958

11/12/02

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Adds: “Yield” 17" to Maple

8959

12/02/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501511)
Adds: “No Parking” west side of 22" from State south
120’

8960

12/02/02

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503(1)
Deletes: “2 Hour Parking” north side of Oak from 4™ west
115’

8961

12/16/02

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.311
Deletes: deletes no left turns from the alleys around the
Maine Center

8962

12/16/02

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.331
Adds: traffic signals at various intersections in the city

8963

12/23/02

Chapter 24, Article I, Section 24.102




Increases: plumbing and sewer opening fees

8964 12/23/02 Chapter 29, Article XI, Section 29.1101
Increases: building permits and demolition fees
8965 12/23/02 Chapter 26, Section 26.003
Increases: electrical permit fees
8966 1/13/03 Chapter 20, Article 11, Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop” 13" at Washington
8967 1/13/03 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501(11)
Adds: “No Parking” north side of Chestnut from 20" west
82’
8968 1/13/03 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Adds: one parking space on north side of Maine between
10" & 11" by Quincy Medical Group
8969 1/13/03 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503
Adds: “3 Hour Parking” in Lincoln Hill NE
8970 1/13/03 Chapter 29, Article XI, Section 29.1101 (amends ordinance
no. 8964)
Increases: building permits and demolition fees
8971 1/27/03 Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Adds: “Yield” 23" to York
8972 1/27/03 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501
Adds: “No Parking” 6 am — 3 pm Monday-Saturday, both
sides of Hampshire east of Front 80" south, 100’ north side
8973 3/03/03 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503(7)
Adds: “3 Hour Parking” on Lincoln Hill NW
8974 3/10/03 Chapter 29, Article X, Local Landmarks
Adds: Sections 29.1081 through 29.1086
8975 3/10/03 Chapter 4
Adds: Section 4.014 checks drawn on insufficient funds
8976 3/24/03 Chapter 23, Article V, Section 23.501
Deletes: Subsection (5) and renumbers subsections
8977 4/28/03 Chapter 20, Article VI, Section 20.602(2)(a)(3)
Amends: spaces for “2 Hour Parking” on Lot |
8978 5/27/03 Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop” Lawrence Road at Lindell Ave. and North
Branch at Lindell Ave.
8979 5/27/03 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.506
Adds: “No Parking” both sides of the N. 18" Street bridge
8980 6/02/03 Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop” Monroe at 18"
8981 6/02/03 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.506
Adds: “No Parking” north side of Cherry Lane from 12"
to 24"
8982 6/23/03 Chapter 11, Article XVIII, Section 11.1804

Change: “BOCA Building Code” & 23.709
To: International Building Code” & 23.609




8983

6/30/03

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345 & 20.330
Deletes: “Yield” 11" and Kentucky
Adds: “Stop” 11" & Kentucky

8984

7/07/03

Chapter 11, Article X111, Section 11.1302 -11.1304
Creates: Washington Theater Redevelopment
Commission; renumbered Sections

8985

7/14/03

Chapter 21, Article 111, Section 21.320; Chapter 32, Section
32.002 & 32.003

Amends: Industrial & Commercial trash pick up; special
use permits time regulated, penalties progressive

8986

7/21/03

Chapter 29, Article XIV, Section 29.1413
Amends: temporary or portable off-premises signs for
2002-2003 closing of Memorial Bridge

8987

7/28/03

Chapter 16, Article VI, Sections 16.601,
16.602,16.603,16.604; Chapter 18, Section 18.003, 18.112;
Chapter 30, Article I, Sections 30.101, 30.109, 30.110,
30.111; Article V, Section 30.508

Amends: Entertainment and patron safety task force

8988

8/04/03

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “4-Way Stop” 52" & Oak, Oak & 52"

8989

8/04/03

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop” Ohio & 15"

8990

8/11/03

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503
Repeals: “15 Minute Parking” west of 8", between
Broadway and Vermont

8991

9/08/03

Chapter 24, Article XVII1, Section 24.1803, 24.1804
Increase: Sewer rates

8992

9/08/03

Chapter 25, Article 111, Section 25.303
Increase: Water rates

8993

9/08/03

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Deletes: “No Parking” east side of 5™, 457north of north
curb line, Kentucky extending 40’ east

8994

9/22/03

Chapter 25, Article V, Section 25.502, 25.505, 25.508,
20.511

Amends: To comply with Illinois EPA cross-connection
regulations

8995

10/27/03

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Add: “Yield”, 15" Yielding for Lind

8996

11/13/03

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Add: “Yield”, Covington Lane and Peach Tree Lane

8997

11/24/03

Chapter 18, Section 18.036 and Chapter 31, Section 31.157
Amend: Underage alcohol solicitation

8998

12/08/03

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Add: “Stop”, 23" Ohio




8999

12/22/03

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503(1)
Adds: “2 Hour” parking, Ohio, north side in front of 815-
817 Ohio

9000

12/29/03

Chapter 29, Section 29.101, 29.203, 29.915, 29.1202,
29.1203

Amends : Brings zoning code requirements in compliance
with “Klaeren decision”.

9001

1/26/04

Chapter 22, Article | Section 22.112, Article 11, Section
22.206, Article 111, Section 22.203, Article V, Section
22.502, 22.503, 22.504, Atrticle VI, Section 22.601-
22.615, Article VII, Section 22.701-22.705, Article VI,
Section 22.801-22.805 ; Chapter 32, (Penalties) Animal
Ordinance

9002

1/02/04

Chapter 20, Article V Section 20.512
Add: “No Parking” around the intersection of 18" &
Locust.

NO #9003

9004

2/9/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503 (7%
Add : “3 Hour Parking”, Hampshire, 28" to 30", north &
south.

9005

2/9/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.602
Add : “2 Hour Parking”, Hampshire, 7" & 8", north side

9006

2/9/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.506
Amends : extends “No Parking” on Broadway, to the east
Corporate City limits.

9007

2/17/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.511
Amends: Vehicles for sale, repair or storage

9008

3/22/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.501 (11)
Add: “No Parking” west side of 6™ St. between Maine and
Jersey, north side of alley, 25’ north

9009

3/22/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503 (2)
Add: “1 Hour Parking” 7" & York 155 west of west curb
line of 7", south side of street

9010

3/22/04

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Add: “Stop Sign” Oak St., walkway between 10™ and 11th

9011

4/12/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Amends: “No Parking” around the intersection of 18" &
Locust. (155)




9012 5/3/04 Chapter 16, Article VI, Section 16.603 (7)
Amend: Expiration: All licenses issued on an annual basis
shall expire on 12/31 of each year.

9013 5/3/04 Chapter 19, Section 19.1502; Chapter 24, Section 24.702
Chapter 29 Section 29.705(7)

Change: BOCA National Property Maintenance Code
To: International Property Maintenance Code

9014 5/17/04 Chapter 13, Section 13.1506
Add: State Officials and Employees Ethics Act
9015 6/21/04 Chapter 29, Section 29.101, Section 29.203
Add: Self-storage facility
9016 6/28/04 Chapter 24, Section 24.303
Add: Lockable ladder
NO #9017
9018 7/12/04 Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503(1)
Add: “2 Hour Parking”, 10" & State
9019 7/12/04 Chapter 18, Section 18.026

Amend: Church locates 100° of property which there is a
preexisting license to sell liquor at retail

9020 8/30/04 Chapter 20, Section 20.512
Add: “No Parking” East side 20th Street, between
Hampshire & Maine, north edge of alley-north 20”

9021 8/30/04 Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Delete: “Yield Sign” Covington Lane & Peach Tree Lane
Add: “Stop Sign” Covington Lane & Peach Tree Lane

9022 9/13/04 Chapter 20, Section 20.330
Add: “Stop Sign”19" and Payson Avenue
9023 9/20/04 Chapter 29, Article X, Local Landmarks
Adds: Sections 29.1087 through 29.1091
9024 10/04/04 Chapter 19, Article IV, Electrical Contractors

Section 19.404, 19.404 (1), 19.404 (3), 19.404 (6), 19.405,
19.406, 19.407, 19.411
Changes in licensing requirements

9025 10/04/04 Chapter 26, Article 333 & 334
26.002 (2) (b), (c), 26.002 (2) (q), 26.003, 26.303 (3),
26.010,
Clarification to permits

9026 10/4/04 Chapter 20, Article 11

Add: “Stop sign”, Cabot Rd & Cambridge Estates




9027

10/25/04

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503
Add: “Parking” space in front of 1806 Chestnut

9028

11/22/2004

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.502 (1)
Add: “Two Hour Parking” northside of Vermont east of
8" Street

9029

11/22/04

Chapter 20, Article 111, section 20.330
Add: “Stop” si%ns, 13" & Payson Ave, with Payson Ave.
stopping for 13"

9030

01/24/05

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Add: “Stop” sign, 15" Payson Ave

9031

01/24/05

Chapter 20, Article VI, Section 20.511
Change: Vehicle for Sale or Repair, Construction or
Maintenance Equipment, Trailers and Motor Homes

9032

02/07/05

Chapter 11, Section 11.903
Add: Commission on Equal Opportunity

9033

3/28/05

Chapter 20, Section 503(7)

Add: 3 Hour parking 7 a.m. — 2 p.m. Woodlawn Dr, Emery

Dr

9034

3/28/05

Chapter 29, Article X, Local Landmarks
Add: Section 29.1092 through 29.1094

9035

4/18/05

Chapter 21, Article |

Delete: Director of Public Works

Add: Director of Planning and Development
Chapter 21.102(1), 21.102 (3)

Add: 3 day notice

Amend: (3) Service of notice

9036

4/18/05

Chapter 20, Article V, 20.506
Delete: Fire lanes, Front Jefferson-Jersey

9037

4/18/05

Chapter 20, Article V, 20.512
Add: (158) 13" & College Ave, No parking zone.

9038

5/2/05

Chapter 26, 26.002, subsection 1
Amend: (1) National Code

9039

5/16/05

Chapter 32, 32.003(2)
Delete: Unnecessary Noises $5.00

9040

5/16/05

Chapter 32, 32.009
Amend: Analysis Fee to $100.00

9041

5/16/05

Chapter 29 Section 1 (billboards)

Add: Standard Outdoor Advertising Structure (SOA)
Delete: BOCA & Basic Building Code references
Add: International Building Code




9042 5/23/05 Chapter 11, section 11.1802, 11.803
Amend: Boards & Commissions, Quorums-7 and
Membership-4
9043 5/31/05 Chapter 31.117
Amend: Paintball Facilities
9044 6/6/05 Chapter 20 Article V, 20.503 (1)
Add: Two hour parking 4™ Maine - Hampshire
9045 6/20/05 Chapter 30, Section 30.401 — 30.405
Amend: Curfew & defenses thereto
9046 6/20/05 Chapter 20, Article 11, Section 20.330
Add: Stop sign 17" & Ohio
9047 6/27/05 Chapter 32, Section 32.009
Amend: Trial fees
9048 7/25/05 Chapter 2, Section 2.102
Amend: Meetings
9049 8/8/05 Chapter 20, Section 20.503 (7)
Amend: 3 hour parking, Holford Dr.
9050 8/8/05 Chapter 20, Section 20.503 (2)
Add: One Hour Parking, 9" & Spring
9051 8/15/05 Chapter 20, Section 20.320.01
Amend: 20 mph speed limit for school days
9052 8/22/05 Chapter 20 Section 20.508 (1)
Add: No parking 22" Cherry
9053 8/29/05 Chapter 20 Section 20.345
Add: Yield 23" Jersey
9054 8/29/05 Chapter 20 Section 20.330
Add: Stop 22™ Hampshire
9055 9/6/05 Chapter 24 Article 111
Add: Swimming Pools
9056 9/6/05 Chapter 11 Article 11.1702
Amend: Boards and Commissions
9057 9/12/05 Chapter 20 Article V, Section 20.506
Add: “No Parking” North side Harrison, 12" & 15th
9058 9/12/05 Chapter 17 Article 111, Article IV
Amend: Ordinance 8943 “Finances”
9059 11/7/05 Chapter 20 Article V, Section 20.508 (1)

Add: “No Parking” north/south Hampshire, 24™ extending
75’ east




9060

11/21/05

Chapter 20 Article 111 Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop Sign” 14™ & Jersey

9061

11/21/05

Chapter 20, Article V Section 20.501 (11)
Adds: “No Parkin%” Chestnut, west of 20" St. 110’
Chestnut, south 20", 50’

9062

11/21/05

Chapter 20, Article V Section 20.508 (1)
Deletes: “No Parking” 120" north east, and 188’ 8" &
Sycamore

9063

11/21/05

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.508 (6)
Amend: “No Parking-School” 193’ East 8" & Sycamore

9064

11/21/05

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Delete: (28) “No Parking” east side 9" & Lind

9065

11/21/05

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Deletes: (29) “No Parking” 9" & Lind, 92’ east

9066

11/21/05

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.412 (120)
Amend: (120) “No Parking” 9™ & Sycamore, north 136’

9067

11/28/05

Chapter 11, Boards & Commission
Add: “Lincoln Bicentennial Commission”

9068

12/5/05

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Adds: (139) “No Parking” North side York, west curb line
of 7" and west 50’

9069

01/09/06

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345
Add: “Yield” Meadow Dr/Brookfield Dr.

9070

01/09/06

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.514
Add: “Bus Stop” 5™ & Hampshire NE 40’ N Hampshire

9071

02/13/06

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512
Add: (28) “No Parking” east side 9™, south Vermont

9072

02/13/06

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330
Adds: “Stop” 23" York
Deletes: “Yield 23rd York

9073

03/20/06

Chapter 1
Deletes: Section 1.002(2)
Substitute: Emergency Power (Mayor)

9074

03/27/06

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503 (2)

Deletes: N.9" West, Spring

Add: “1 Hour Parking”, N. 9™ West, 20" S. Spring
Adds: “1 Hour Parking”, Spring, S., 30’ W. 9th

9075

04/03/06

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.503 (1)
Adds: “2 Hour Parking”, 9", W., State, S. to alley

9076

04/03/06

Chapter 20, Article 11, Section 20, 320.1
Adds: “20 mph, school”, Jackson from 9" to 11"




9077 06/05/06 Chapter 23, Article 3, Section 23.301 (4) (b)
Repealed and replaced in entirety (b)
9078 06/05/06 Chapter 20, Section 20.330 (1)
Adds: “Stop” 21* & Monroe
9079 07/17/06 Chapter 19, Section 19.313 (False Alarms)
Delete and replace — Fees and charges
9080 08/21/06 Chapter 20, Article 111
Adds: “Stop” 22" Aldo Blvd
9081 08/21/06 Chapter 20, Article 111
Adds: “Yield” Evangeline Rd & Cabot Rd
9082 08/21/06 Chapter 32, Section 32.003(2)
Amends: Penalties
9083 09/11/06 Chapter 32, Section 32.003(2)
Amends: Uptown Overtime parking from $10 to $5
9084 09/18/06 Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Adds: “Yield” sign West Evergreen Dr./Holiday Dr.
9085 09/18/06 Chapter 20, Section 20.501 (11)
Adds: “No Parking” 24™ west side, N Wilmar Dr N 30’
9086 10/10/06 Chapter 23, Section 23.101(17)
Amends: Barriers, Fences
9087 10/16/06 Chapter 23, Article 11, Section 23.301
Amends: Fire Protection Guard
9088 10/16/06 Chapter 29, Section 29.101(2)(a)
Adds: Fee for Salvage
9089 10/16/06 Chapter 29, Section 29.1095 & 29.1096 Landmarks
Adds: 900 Madison, 200 S Front
9090 10/16/06 Chapter 32, Section 32.010
Adds: Contribution to Quincy Regional Crime Stoppers
9091 10/30/06 Chapter 9, Section 9.014(3)
Amends: Duties of Auxiliary Police Officers
9092 10/30/06 Chapter 29, Section 29.1097, Landmarks
Adds: 415 S 10", 1015 Kentucky, 1016 Kentucky, 1022
Kentucky, 1030 Kentucky, 1031 Kentucky, 1032 Kentucky,
1033 Kentucky
9093 12/4/06 Chapter 11, Section 11.701 — 11.709
Amends: Board of Zoning Appeals
9094 12/11/06 Chapter 23, Section 23.701

Amends: Carbon Monoxide Alarm




9095

12/26/06

Chapter 25, Section 25.303
Amends: Water Rate increase

9096

12/26/06

Chapter 24, Section 24.1803
Amends: Plumbing & Sewer Rate increase

9097

01/02/07

Chapter 20, Section 20.320.8

Amends: “25 MPH”, Holiday Dr, Park PIl., Willow Ck.,
Wilderness Trl., Breckenridge, Harrison Plz., Windham
Est., Homestead, Northridge

9098

01/02/07

Chapter 20, Section 20.320.06
Adds: “35 MPH” 18" & Seminary Rd. and Koch’s Lane

9099

01/02/07

Chapter 20, Section 20.501 (11)
Adds: “No Parking” 13" east, west side Whewell Ave. to
Elm

9100

01/22/07

Chapter 29, Section 29.1008(2) Landmark & Historic Dist.
Deletes: (2) Add: Applicant & property owners

Chapter 29, Section 29.1009

Deletes: 1009 Add: Nominations, Hearings, Notifications

9101

3/19/07

Chapter 29, Section 29.1098, 1099,10.1100,
10.1101,10.1102 Landmarks

Adds: 2328 Hawthorne, 2102 Jersey, 234 S. 16", 502 N
28" 2409 Country Club Dr. S.

9102

3/26/07

Chapter 20, Section 20.501 (11)
Adds: “No Parking” 6™ eastside 40” N. of State

9103

3/26/07

Chapter 20, Section 20.501 (11)
Adds: “No Parking” 6" Westside 75’ N. of State

9104

4/2/07

Chapter 29, Definitions, Section 29.202 (5), 29.203(2),
29.202(10)(a)(8)(b)(1,2), 29.302(10)(a)(4), 29.405, 29.704,
29.1101(1)(b), 29.1101(2)(a)(9), 29.1101(2)(b), 29.1111,
29.1404(3), 29.1410,29.1410(1), 29.701(4)(a),
29.1402(2)(j), 29.1410(1)(a), 29.1403(2), 29.1411(1)(9),
29.1404(b)(3), 29.1406(7), 29.1406(11-14),
29.1411(1)(e)(2-4), 29.1411(3)(d), 29.1413(4,5), 29.1502
(1,2), 29.1503(4), 29.1504(h), 29.1505(d)

Amends: Group Homes and Halfway Homes, Side Street
wall signs, Sign permit fees, Moving/Flashing signs, pole
signs, Site plan review, application procedures.

9105

7/16/07

Chapter 19, Article 11
Repealed: Handbills
Chapter 21, Section 21.411
Adds: Handbills

9106

9/04/07

Chapter 20, Article 5
Adds: “Parking”, Maine, 9" & 10th




9107

9/04/07

Chapter 20, Article 5
Adds: “No Parking” Lindell Ave, Ellington School 7:45
a.m.-8:45 a.m. and 2:30 p.m.-3:30 p.m.

9108

9/04/07

Chapter 20, Article 5
Adds: “No Parking” 7" Madison, 16™-17" Madison 8:00
a.m.- 9:00 a.m., 2:15 p.m.-3:15 p.m.

9109

9/4/07

Chapter 20, Article 3
Adds: “20 mph” 8" & Monroe-Jackson
Deletes: “20 mph” 10" Cedar — Spruce, Spruce — 11th

9110

9/04/07

Chapter 20, Article 3
Deletes: “Stop Light” 7" & Maine

9111

9/04/07

Chapter 20, Article 3
Adds: “4-Way Stop” 10" & Oak and Oak & 10™

9112

10/9/07

Chapter 11, Section 11.1102 (Membership) Lincoln
Bicentennial Commission
Amend: “add 2 members of County Board”

9113

11/19/07

Chapter 20, Section 20.508
Add: “No Parking” 8" Sycamore north 165 ft. 7:00 a.m. —
8:00 a.m., 2:00 p.m. — 3:00 p.m.

9114

11/26/07

Chapter 29, Section 29.705
Amend: Fences, Berms & finished elevations

9115

12/31/07

Chapter 30, Article XI, Section 30.1102
Add: Adoption of Cable/Video Protection Law

9116

12/31/07

Chapter 30, Article XI, Section 30.1103
Add: Cable/Video Service fee, PEG

9117

01/22/08

Chapter 20, Section 20.349
Add: Neighborhood Electric Vehicles

9118

01/28/08

Chapter 19, Section 19.404, 19.404(5), 19.411, 19.413,
26.002, 26.003

Add: Electrical License, Fees, Exemptions, Rules &
Regulations

9119

01/28/08

Chapter 18, Section 18.001, 18.006, 18.110
Add: Beer Garden

9120

02/11/08

Chapter 20, Section 20.501 (27)
Add: “Parking” 20" Maine — Hampshire S. 20’

9121

02/11/08

Chapter 19, Section 19.404 (e)
Delete: Limitations

9122

03/11/08

Chapter 30, Section 30.1101 — 30.1101.23
Add: Construction of Utility Facilities in the right-of-way

9123

03/24/08

Chapter 20, Section 20.320.01
Add: Speed limit 20 mph, school zone 8" Kentucky




9124 04/14/08 Chapter 21, 23, 29, Section 21.101, 23.102-106, 23.501-
504, 23.801, 802, 23.901-906, 29.117
Amend: Construction regulations, Housing standards,
Family dwellings
9125 04/21/08 Chapter 29, Sections 29.1103, 04, 05, 06, 07, 08, 09, 10,
Add: Landmark-133 East Ave, 205 S 16", 228 S 18", 1111
N 18", 221 N 24™, 1124 S 9", 1805 Maine, 1809 Maine
9126 05/05/08 Chapter 29, Section 29.1101
Delete: 29.117
Add: (e) Penalties 29.1101
9127 5/19/08 Chapter 18, Section 18.006
Add: Language to Alcoholic Liquor Dealers Class A & H
9128 06/02/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.503 (6)
Add: Alley 28" — 30" Maine-Hampshire
9129 06/16/08 Chapter 26, Section 26.002 (1)
Add: National Code
9130 07/21/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.501(11)
Delete: (11)
Add: (11), 12" St. eastside Jackson 65 north
9131 07/21/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.503
Add: (9) “Two Hour Parking” northside State St. 17’ east
centerline 15" St. west 96; west of centerline
9132 09/22/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.320.9
Add: “45 MPH” 63" between Broadway and State St.
9133 10/27/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.512
Add: (163) “No Parking” alley 7" — 8" Maine-Jersey
Southside extending east 87’
9134 10/27/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.506
Add: “No Parking” 48" Harrison, west side, 140’ south,
north 140" Woodland Trail
9135 10/27/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.503(1)
Add: “Two Hour Parking, 8-5 p.m. except Sundays &
Holidays” 28" Maine, south side, east 305’ west
9136 10/27/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.508(1)
Delete: “Parking” Payson Ave, N., 9", 283" west.
9137 10/27/08 Chapter 20, Section 20.330(1)
Add: “4 Way Stop” 7" & Van Buren.
9138 02/09/09 Chapter 13, Article I, Personnel Code
Delete: Article 11 substitute: Article 11 Personnel Code
9139 03/02/09 Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.345

Add: “Yield” 16" Winsor Dr.




9140

03/09/09

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330(1)
Add: “4-way Stop” 23" & Aldo Blvd

9141

04/06/09

Chapter 19, Article VII, Section 19.704
Delete: Add: Records

9142

04/13/09

Chapter 29, Article VII, Section 6 & 29.202
Sign definition, Internally lighted signs.

9143

04/27/09

Chapter 25, Section 25.303
Increase Water rates

9144

04/27/09

Chapter 24, Section 24.1803, 1804
Increase Sewer rates

9145

04/27/09

Chapter 29, Section 29.10.1111, 29.10.1112, 29.10.1113,
29.10.1114, 29.10.1115

Add: Landmarks-532 Gardner Exp., 613 N.12", 1673
Maine, 608 Adams, 614-618 Maine,

9146

06/08/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Delete: “Yield Sign” 16™ Kentucky
Add: “Stop Sign” 16" Kentucky

9147

06/08/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.330(1)
Add: “Stop Sign” 16" Jackson

9148

06/08/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.320.1

Add: “School Zone” 7™, Monroe to 200’ south of Adams;
AdaLns between a point 200 east of 8" to a point 200" west
of 7"

9149

06/15/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Add: “Yield” New Castle, Harrison Plaza

9150

07/27/09

Chapter 29, Section 29.302(5)
Amend: (5) 100’ above grade in the M2 district

9151

07/27/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.330(1)
Add: “Stop” 22" & Vermont

9152

07/27/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Add: “Yield” 11" Monroe, 16" Madison

9153

07/27/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.320.8

Amend: “25 mph” Holiday Dr., Park Place, 29" Broadway
and Whewell Dr., Whewell Dr. between 29" and 30™,
Willow Creek, Wilderness Trail, Breckenridge, Harrison
Plaza, Windham Estates, Homestead and Northridge

9154

07/27/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.506
Add: “Parking” 6™ west-side 100°N. Ohio

9155

07/27/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.506
Delete: 16™ East-side Locust 320 north




9156

09/28/09

Chapter 19, Section 19.901
Add: For hire (Taxi Cab or Limousine)

9157

09/28/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.501(11)
Add: “No Parking”, 2" St. east side Maine, north 82’

9158

09/29/09

Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Add: “Yield” 11" & Madison

9159

10/26/09

Chapter 30, Article X
Add: Fair housing — Unfair practices

9160

11/30/09

Chapter 12, Article 111
Add: Hydropower Corporation

9161

12/07/09

Chapter 13, Article XVII
Amend: 13.1710 Annual Budget: prior inspection: public
hearing

9162

02/08/10

Chapter 8, Section 8.003
Amend: Fire Deputy Chiefs

9163

02/16/10

Chapter 20, Article V, Section 20.512 (125)
Add: “Parking” South side Hampshire, 6™ extend west 30’
west

9164

02/16/10

Chapter 20, Article 111, Section 20.330(1)
Add: “Stop” 11" & Oak

9165

02/22/10

Chapter 29, Section 29.1403(2)
Amend: Frontage

9166

03/22/10

Chapter 14, Section 14.701
Delete: Harrison, 12" to East City Limits
Add: Harrison, 12" to 48"

9167

03/33/10

Chapter 2, Section 2.208
Amend: Public Forum

9168

04/26/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.501(11)
Add: “No Parking” Koch’s Ln. 50’ east se corner Hwy 24
& Koch’s extending east 535°.

9169

06/01/10

Chapter 21, Chapter 23, Section 23.1010, 23.1002,
23.1003, 23.1005-23.1019, 23.1020

Delete: Chapter 21, Article 1l (Fire Prevention)
Add: Chapter 23, Article X (Fire Prevention)

9170

08/02/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.508
Add: (10) “No Parking” 22" Cherry west 620" M-F,
7:00a.m. —3:30 p.m.

9171

08/02/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.330(1)
Add: “Stop” 25" & Spring

9172

08/02/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Add: 23" & Adams




9173

08/02/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.501(11)
Add: “No Parking” High Street, north side, east curbline
24" east 260’

9174

08/09/10

Chapter 13, Section 13.127
Delete: Residency-Employees and Officers

9175

09/07/10

Chapter 29, Section 29.202(e), 29.1409(8), 29.1411(d)
Amend: Ground mounted signs, Corner clearance
requirements

9176

09/20/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.503(1)
Add: “2 Hour Parking”, 8" & Ohio

9177

09/27/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.320.1
Add: 20 mph school speed zones Jersey 12"-16, 14™ from
Maine to Jersey

9178

09/27/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.320.01
Delete: 20 mph school speed zone located on South 8"
Street near Payson Avenue

9179

09/27/10

Chapter 20, Section 20.345
Add: “Yield” sign at the intersection of South 21* and Van
Buren Streets with South 21% Street yielding to Van Buren)

9180

01/31/11

Chapter 13, Section 13.215
Delete-Substitute: Dependent health insurance coverage when
city employee is on approved, extended medical leave




